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Since 1988, more than 
500 foreign takeovers 
and investments in US 
firms have been reported 
to the Committee on 
Foreign Investment in 
the United States 
(CFIUS), which is 
charged with checking 
these actions for 
national security impact. 
CFIUS has blocked only 
one such investment. In 
many instances, the 
foreign penetration has 
been in high-technology 
sectors. 
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Related to the problem of 
increased reliance on 
foreign sources is the 

steady deterioration of 
US leadership in military 

technologies. For more 
on the defense industrial 

base, see "Declining, 
Diversifying, and 

Disappearing" and 
"Lifelines Abroad" in 

this issue. 
Source Department  of  Commerce 
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Problems in Key Sectors 
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US armed forces are 
nervous about their 
increasing reliance on 
foreign sources. Of the 
problems identified in 
key sectors by Air Force 
Systems Command in its 
July 1990 report, AFSC 
Industrial Base Assess-
ment, the dominant 
factor was foreign 
dependence. 
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